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../ The centenary of the discovery of the 
leprosy hacillus is an appropriate occasion 
on which to revive the Illelllory of a crimi­
nal prosecution which is quite exceptional , 
at any rate in Norwcgian legal annals. The 
special interest of the case lies pmtly in its 
close concern with the personal and profes­
sional integrity of an eminent physician 
and scientist, and partly in its probing of 
the question as to what extent the physi­
cian may be restricted hy law as regards his 
freedolll to deal with his patients as he 
thinks best- a question that even today is of 
topical interest. 

/ THE CASE 

Armaucr Hansen was installed as a doc­
tor at the Leprosy Hospital in Bergen in 
1868, and in 1875 he also became Chief 
Medical Officer for leprosy in Norway. 

As a result of his studies of the dissemi­
nation of leprosy, hc had arrivcd at a 
personal conviction that the disease was 
infectious but he had not yet obtained any 
evidence for this that would satisfy thc 
requirements of scientific proof. As latc as 
1885 ( 1) he formulated the problem in the 
following way. If one is to arrive at a sound 
conclusion that a disease owes its origin to 
a bacillus, three requirements must b e 
fulfilled. First, the bacillus in question must 
be present in every case of the disease; 
second, one must b e alk to cultivatc the 
bacillus outside the human organism; third , 
the bacillus thus grown must be capable 
of inducing the disease on inoculation into 
a human being or an a nimal. In this case it 
was the third condition that had not been 
fulfilled which concerned Hansen, sinec all 
the animals (dogs, cats, rabbits , monkeys, 
and fish) on which inoculatioll had been 
attempted appeared to he immune to thc 
disease. 

TTe had himself earlier tried , in vain, 
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inoculation in rabbits, and it must be as­
sllliH'd that he was aware of the attempts at 
inoculating human patients that had previ­
ously been carried out in Norway. Thereaf­
ter, he had let . his efforts rest until Dr. 
Koch's description of the tubercle bacillus 
came to his notice, apprising him of the 
conditions laiel down by Koch for the scien­
tific recognition of a bacillus as the cause of 
a disease. This treatise inspired Armauer 
Hansen to undertake fresh studies and 
must be regarded as the immediate incen­
tiw to his action of 3 November 1879 at the 
Leprosy Hospital in Bergen, wh~n h e inoc­
ulateel material taken from a leprous nod­
ule into the eye of a femal e patient who 
probabl y suffered from borderline lcprosy 
according to th e modern classification. 

It seems that even before this episode 
the relationship between Armauer Hansen 
and many of the leprosy patients in the 
hospital was not a particularly happy one; 
primarily, perhaps, becausc of his constant­
ly repeated insistence OD the need for isola­
tion, forcibly imposed if n ecessary, as a 
measure to prevent the spreading of thc 
d·isease. His openly expressed opinion that 
"one was oneself to blamc" for b ecoming 
infected with leprosy can scarcely havc 
contributed to the improvemc"nt of the rela­
tionship (~ ). At any rate a considerable 
commotion arose in the leprosy hospital 
after the event in question, and the pastor 
there reported the incident to the supervi­
sory board. The board inte1Togated the girl 
and Armauer Hansen and referred the 
matter to the Ministry of Justice. 

As a result of the inquiry, subsequently 
instituted by the Ministry, thc following 
facts came to light. 

"The girl ," who was 33 years old and who 
had been at the hospital since she was 16, 
stated that during a visit by Armauer Han­
sen she was requested hy him to accompa­
ny him to his office sine(' he wished to 
speak to ,her. She did not know what it was 
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all about, but nevertheless became so anx­
ious that she burst into tears at th e entrance 
to the office. H e th en bade her come up to 
the table and lifted up a sharp instrument 
towards her eye. She raised her arm to 
protect herself, but was calmed down by 
the superintendent of the hospital , who was 
present in the office. She then sat down in 
a chair, whereupon she was twice pricked 
in the eye. She thought the pricks were 
vcry painful , and she suffered pain as a 
result for .several weeks aftenvards. She 
was also of the opinion that her sight had 
weaken ed. 

Armauer Hansen admitted that he had 
twice pierced her eye with a sharp needle 
which he had previously passed through a 
nodule of a leprous patient. H e also ad­
mitted that he had not first explained to 
her what he wished to do. Inside the office 
he had only told her that he would give her 
a prick in the eye, but "the purpose of this 
treatmcnt he did not disclose to her." H e 
added that the only thing '>vith which he 
thought he could reproach himself was that 
he 'had not told her b eforehand what he 
wished to do, but offered as a justification 
for this that he could not "presuppose that 
the patient would regard the experiment 
from the same point of view as I myself 
did." 

This perforation was intended to lead to 
the formation of a leprous nodule in her 
eye. H e would then have excised the nod­
ule in order to prevent her suffering any 
injury to her sight. On a couple of previous 
occasions he had, with complete success, 
removed incipient leprous nodules from 
eyes and he was of the opinion that he 
certainly could do so again on the present 
occasion. Nor did he think that the forma­
ti on of a nodule in th e eye would have led 
to a general outbreak of nodules, since he 
could have prevented a general infection 
by removing th e nodule in time. H e added 
that patients with the anesthetic form of 
leprosy had been known to develop nod­
ul es, and since they were thus exposed to an 
inherent poss ibility of developing nodules, 
he was of the opinion that it was less 
questionabl e to undertake the experiment. 

As regards the consequences of the per­
foration , it was quite clear that no nodule 

formation had occurred, but instead a mi­
nor inflammation occurred which had 
healed spontaneously in the course of 
several weeks and had not caused any 
permanent harm. To what extent the per­
foration or the subsequent inBammation 
had caused the patient pain was not quite 
clear, but, according to the information 
availabl e, it appeared that she had exag­
gerated considerably in this respect. 

When the Chief Magistrate in Bergen 
transmitted th e record of the inquiry to the 
Ministry, he commented that Armauer 
Hansen, without th e pati ent's consent and 
against her wishes, had undertaken an op­
eration which apparently had not caused 
and possibly could not cause las ting dam­
age to her eye, but had nevertheless occa­
sioned her much anxiety and not inconsid­
erabl e pain . Armauer Hansen was well 
aware of this , and it was moreover his 
intention to inflict on the patient "a more 
malignant form" of the leprous disease than 
the one she already suffered. The Chief 
Magistrate therefore· proposed a charge 
against Armauer Hansen of occasioning ac­
tual bodily harm to an innocent party .. 

Before the Ministry came to any conclu­
sion, expressions of opinion were sought 
from the City Medical Officer, Bidenkap, 
and from the Director of Public Health. 

Bidenkap, who was a university lecturer 
in medicine, expressed the opinion that the 
Chief Magistrate had misunderstood the 
case in-so-far as he was of the opinion that 
Armauer Hansen had intended to inflict on 
the patient a more serious form of the 
disease than she already had . The informa­
tion regarding the patient's disease justified 
the conclusion that th e sensitivity in the 
eye's connective tissue was lessened, but 
not completely lost. 

The Director of Public H ealth adopted 
Bidenkap's opinion and found that for ad­
ministrative purposes no further action was 
called for than "to proceed to administer a 
severe reprimand to Hansen, who under­
took the experiment in order to discover 
the answer to a question of the greatest 
importance in the interests not only of 
science and the nation, but also of the 
leprosy pati ent's own environment, and 
who, in my opinion, has already performed 
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vital services in seeking the answer to this 
questi on." 

The Ministry of Justi ce decided to draft 
proposals for two royal decrees relating to 
the case. In one of the two drafts the 
Ministry declared its agreement with the 
Chief Magistrate that Armauer Hansen's 
conduct was of such a character that it was 
imperative to bring a charge against him. 
The Ministry expressly stated that there 
was a case for conviction under the provi­
sions of chapters 24 and 27 of the current 
Criminal Code. It was therc p rovided that 
if a senior government offi cial misused his 
position against his better judgment so as to 
injure anyone, the penalty .was loss of his 
offi ce. 

In the second draft, the Mini stry advo­
cated the abolition of the existing joint 
tenure of the appointment as Chief Medi­
cal Officer for leprosy and the appointment 
as a doctor at the Leprosy Hospital in 
Bergen. This apparently purely administra­
tive reorganization was justified by the ar­
gument that, in the Ministry's opinion, Ar­
mauer H ansen had not misconducted him­
self in his capacity as Chief Medical Officer 
for leprosy, but only in his capacity as a 
doctor at the Leprosy Hospital. The Direc­
tor of Public Health had indeed expressed 
an opinion that Armauer Hansen had in­
curred considerable ill-will among the ma­
jority of the leprosy patients. However, he 
was of the opinion that it would raise an 
obstacle to the solution of an important 
problem if Armauer Hansen were removed 
from his position as Chief Medical Officer 
for leprosy, and that the state of opinion 
among the leprosy patients ought not under 
any circumstances to be allowed to exert 
any influence in this respect. Therefore, the 
Director of Public Health had proposed 
that the connection between the two posts 
should be terminated and the Ministry 
adopted this proposal. The Ministry 
referred to the fact that the Chief Magis· 
trate, in the light of the availabl e informa­
tion, had assumed that what had happened 
had to a great degree aggravated the iJl­
feeling among the patients in the hospital, 
so that Armauer H ansen "will in future 
scarcely enjoy such a degree of confidence 
as would enable him to carry out his duties 

as a doctor at the Leprosy Hospital success­
full y." 

The Government by royal decrees issued 
on 17 April 1880 adopted both the propos­
als put forward by the Ministry. 

The criminal prosecution against Ar­
mauer H ansen was brought into the city 
court in Bergen and, according to newspa­
per J·epOlts, lasted only four hours. The 
judgment of the court delivered on 31 May 
1880 is report (O'd in full in Professor Vogel­
sang's book (3) and I shall confine myself 
to recapitulating the main points. 

In accordance with Armauer H ansen's 
own admissions, the court found it proven 
that he had acted in the manner set out in 
the charge, namely that he had pierced the 
eye of the girl, Kari Nielsdatter Spidsoen, 
an inmate of the hospital, with a sharp 
needle which had a short time previously 
been passed through a nodule of a patient 
suffering from lepromatous leprosy. Still in 
conformity wi th Armauer H ansen's state­
ment, the COUlt found it establi shed that he 
had without just cause done her an injury, 
and that he had not beforehand obtained 
her consent to the perforation or informed 
her of its purpose. The pain that he had 
caused the patient was not inconsiderable, 
even if her imagination had led her to give 
a more vivid account of it than correspond­
ed to sober fact. Since the patient had not 
firml y opposed the operation, but had, on 
the contrary, remained passive after a 
soothing address and had only requested 
that her oth er eye should not be touched, 
the court found that the more stringent 
provisions of chapter 15 section 11 ( 4) of 
the Criminal Justice Act were inapplicable 
to the case, so that only section 10 (5) was 
applicable, all the more so since there was 
no question of any animus injuriondi on the 
part of the accused. But the COUlt found 
that, "The accused, however much the fore­
going submissions may be urged in defense 
of his conduct from a medical and scientific 
point of view, by reason of the course of 
action he followed, th e facts of which he 
has quite openly admitted , has with clear 
intent taken advantage of his positi on in 
relation to the first witness so as to cause 
her bodily injury, which, as he himself 
admits, he could not assume that she would 



202 International Journal of Lepr'osy 1973 

have consented to undergo, if hc had be­
forehand acquainted her with its nature." 

Armauer Hansen was cpnsequently liable 
to ,punishment under the provisions of 
chapter 24, section 27, subsection (I) (6) 
cf. section 32 (7) of the Criminal Code. 

As to the sentence to be imposed, the 
court stated that in view of the nature of 
the accused's conduct and in view of the 
cvidence given of the feelings aroused 
among the patients by what had hap­
pencd, there could be no question of the 
inAiction of any other penalty than loss of 
the office in whioh he, after the events in 
question, could scarcely function as suc­
cessfully as before. But since the accused's 
conduct was not such that he had thereby 
rendered himself unfit for the post of Chief 
Medical Officer for leprosy, and since this 
office was now distinct from the appoint­
ment as a doctor at the Leprosy Hospital, 
there was no reason to extend the forfeiture 
of office to any other than the last­
mentioned post, which was the one in 
which he had misdemeaned himself. 

The sentence passed, which tallied with 
what the prosecutor advocated, amounted 
to forfeiture of the post of doctor at the 
Leprosy Hospital' in conjunction with a 
liability to pay 90 kroner, the costs of the 
case. 

According to the information available to 
me, there is every reason to believe that the 
judgment was not appealed to a higher 
court. 

In an endorsement dated 22 June 1880, 
the Ministry requested that Armauer Han­
sen be informed that "the Ministry also in 
the public interest acquiesces in the judg­
Inent." 
. Vogelsang writes in his book (8) that the 
Judgment aroused great interest in scien­
tific circles and in part was strongly criti­
cized. It is, I suppose, probable that this 
was indeed the case, but a search of the 
press files has not brought to light anything 
but strictly objective reports of the case, 
and I cannot find it discussed in medical 
journals of that period either. A reasonable 
explanation is , perhaps, that both the daily 
papers and the scientific periodicals of 
those days were considerably mOre reticent 
as regards critical discussion of lawsuits 
than they are today. 

LEGAL ANALYSIS 

A sober cvaluation of Armauer Hansen's 
conduct and of the criminal prosecution 
brought against him must start with a prop­
er appreciation of the conditions prevalent 
at that time. 

It must have been a dominant feature of 
t>h e contemporary scene that leprosy was 
regarded as a catastrophe, both for those 
afflicted with it and for society as a whole. 
The services rendered by Armauer Hansen 
in the fight against leprosy cannot be called 
in question, and it is no less certain that 
what he did to the girl , Kari Nielsdatter, in 
November 1879, appeared to him to be a 
desirable and practically necessary step in 
his task of proving that the disease was 
infectious. On the other hand, there is 
every reason to believe that a more or less 
enforced isolation in the lazarets must have 
weighed as an extra burden on the leprosy 
patients themselves. Especially so, because 
the general conditions in such institutions 
can surely be assumed to have been lacking 
in humane amenities' when measured by 
yardsticks such as we would apply today. It 
has been made sufficiently clear that Ar­
mauer Hansen, even before the episode of 
1879, had incurred a considerable amount 
of ill-feeling among many of the leprosy 
patients, and it seems reasonable to assume 
that they had come to regard him as the 
personification of the grievous fate that life 
and society had inflicted on them. Against 
such a background, what he did must have 
appeared as a very high-handed act both to 
Kari herself and to many of her fellow 
sufferers. 

In his statement of defense, Armauer 
Hansen mentions that similar inoculation 
had earlier been practiced on leprosy pa­
tients without complaint. Vogelsang states 
(9) that as early as 1844, Danielssen had 
inoculated material from a leprous nodule 
into himself, as well as into two hospital 
orderlies and a nurse, with a negative result 
in every case. H e undertook similar experi­
ments on subsequent occasions, and in 1857 
he carried out inoculation on a number of 
patients with syphilis and scabies. If this 
latter experiment was carried out without 
the patients' permission, the case would 
seem to be on all fours with that of Ar-
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mauer Hansen. The reason why there was 
no reaction in these instances is open to 
speculation. To me it appears a not too 
remote possibility that at that p eriod there 
was no one who was prepared to champion 
the patients' cause. Their social position 
must indeed have been so weak that they 
would in fact h ave found it difficult to 
lodge a justified complaint. It reflects great 
credit on Gronvold, the pastor at the Lep­
rosy Hospital, that in 1879 he took it upon 
himself to put forward Kari Nielsdatter's 
complaints. But on the whole it seems that 
Armauer Hansen was not far from the truth 
when he stated that what he had done was 
not anything exceptional or disturbingly 
novel. 

Nevertheless, one is faced with the fact 
that even though his medical colleagues 
greatly exerted themselves in an effOIt to 
find extenuating circumstances for his con­
duct, there is nothing in the records of the 
case to support the view that any of them 
regarded his conduct as correct. According­
ly, I am prepared to assume that his con­
duct would have been acceptable in the 
li ght of the medical ethics of that period if 
he had first obtained the patient's consent, 
but that he overstepped the limit by carry­
ing out the operation without consent, 
without giving the patient the necessary 
information, and, moreover, in spite of a 
certain amount of resistance on her patt. 

From a legal point of view, the case can 
scar.cely have aroused much doubt as far as 
the question of guilt was concerned. The 
action taken plainly included a bodily in­
jury to the patient, and Hansen had taken 
advantage of his position as a doctor at the 
Leprosy Hospital to trespass on one of the 
patients who was placed under his care. 
Neither the prosecuting authority nor the 
court can have enteltained any doubt that 
his essentially laudable motives for inflict­
ing such treatment could not exculpate him. 

On the other hand, the question of the 
way in which the case ought to be dealt 
with must have aroused considerable 
doubts. To overlook the complaint, or to 
dismiss it quietly even if this had appeared 
defensible from other pOints of view, was 
practically impossible once pastor Gronvold 
hnrl tc>lr"n lln th p (' ~ ~p. ~nrl it had aroused 

the commotion that it did, To go to the 
other extreme, namely, complete forfeiture 
of both Hansen's appointments, with pos­
sibly the infliction of some additional pen­
alty, must have appeared to be an unrea­
sonably severe reaction, and a reaction that 
would not only have struck Armauer Han­
sen a harder blow than he deserved, but 
could 'also have led to the consequence that 
the country's leading scientist in this fi eld 
would have been barred from its further 
participation, and the struggle against lep­
rosy would have suffered a lasting setback. 

Accordingly, the government chose to 
follow the proposal of the Director of Pub­
lic H ealth, namely, to sever the two ap­
pointments. This would enable the court to 
disqualify Hansen from only one of them, 
and to allow him to retain the office of 
Chief Medical Officer for leprosy. From a 
purely legal point of view one can, I think, 
regard such a procedure with some scepti­
cism. Strictly speaking, Hansen's misde­
meanor was committed both in his capacity 
as a doctor at the Leprosy Hospital arid in 
his capacity as Chief Medical Officer for 
leprosy. But the government's decision 
nevertheless appears to me to have been a 
wise move, and the court can scarcely have 
found much difficulty in adopting the pro­
posal for punishment that, the government 
had, so to speak, thereby presented and 
that the prosecutor had advocated. 

Consequently, the outcome was, as 
Vogelsang writes, a legal decision that 
made it plain "that even a celebrated scien­
tist is bound to obey t>h e law of the land, 
and that it is the court's duty to protect 
every citizen also against encroachments 
from more influential persons" (10). 

The case had scarcely any consequences 
as regards Armauer Hansen's scientific 
work or renown. H e continued to hold the 
post of Chief Medical Officer for leprosy as 
long as he lived, and in an article written in 
1885 he states almost as if it were a self­
evident corollary "that we cannot experi­
ment with human b eings." 

As regards the other protagonist in the 
drama, "the girl, Kari Nielsdatter Spid­
soen," however, we hear nothing more. We 
know little of what the case can have 
meant for her, and nothing of her later life. 
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But if one, with the help of a little imagina­
tion, tri es to appreciate her position, what 
she was subjected to, and the fate that she, 
like most other leprosy pati ents had to 
face, I , for my part, have no doubt that the 
conviction was correct even from the pure­
ly humane point of view. 

DISCUSSION 

If we then ask ourselves whether the 
forensic approach in the Armauer Hansen 
case has any relevance today, we must not 
omit from our consideration the factor that 
medical technic has developed enormously 
in the years that have intervened. Oper­
ations and experiments that were earlier 
unknown have today become common­
place, and one would scarcely venture to 
predict how far the t echnical advance will 
continue in the future. It would also be 
unlikely that medical ethics have not al­
tered in many ways during the course of 
these years. But a lawyer has not the neces­
sary insight to pronounce on this theme. 

Accordingly, the answer to our question 
will, at any rate as regards Norwegian law, 
have to be given with considerable reserva­
tion. On several occasions it has, for in­
stance, been authoritatively stated that 
what is generally accepted as defensible 
and sound medical practice must to a great 
extent be accepted as lawful. As a typical 
example I can mention the discussion relat­
ing to the problem of abortion which took 
place in Norway at the end of the 1950s. 
Section 245 of the Norwegian Criminal 
Code of 1902 penalized the unlawful termi­
nation of a pregnancy or its aiding or 
abetting. The statute itself offered no 
guidance as to the circumstances in which 
termination of a pregnancy was "unlawful," 
but there is little doubt that when the 
statute was enacted, the general opinion 
was that only when a serious threat to the 
mother's life or health actually existed, in 
other words an emergency situation in the 
strictest sense, was it permissibl e to termi­
nate the pregnancy. In thc years between 
the two world wars, however, opinion with­
in the medical profession altered . Gradual­
ly, house surgeons considered themselves 
justified in extending this licensed area so 
as to include purely medical indications, 

and upon occasion even eugenic and eth­
ical factors wcre decisive, while in cspecial­
ly precarious cases abortus provocatus was 
undeltaken on the additional basis of social 
and humanitarian considerations. The 
prosecuting authorities in Norway took no 
action against this new practice, and our 
leading jurist in the field of criminal law, 
Professor Johs. Andenl:es, in an article writ­
ten in 1956 (12), commented that the new 
practice must now be accepted as enjoying 
legal sanction, since the principle of the 
balance of interests which lay behind the 
emergency rule must lead to a result differ­
ent from what one thought 50 years earlier. 
In the preliminary stages of drafting a new 
Abortion Act this view was then also ac­
cepted as fundamental by the legislative 
authorities, and the purpose of our new Act 
of II November 1960 relating to termina­
tion of pregnancy was not to formulate new 
law, but to provide clearer rules about the 
extent to which medical intervention was 
lawful, and what procedure should be 
adopted . I may add that it seems as if the 
practice in the past t en years has proceed­
ed in the direction of a constantly progres­
sive liberalization, and that this factor is 
invoked in current discussion as one of the 
arguments in favor of going over to unre­
stricted abortion. 

Thus I think it right initially to base one's 
view on the proposition that what is ac­
Gepted as ethically defensible in responsi­
ble medical circles will also be accepted by 
the courts as lawful. Conversely, a form of 
practice that is unacceptable from a re­
sponsible medical angle will scarcely be 
accepted by the courts. However, this is no 
more than a starting point. Statutory provi­
sions with definite, and not arbitrary, cri­
teria cannot be reshaped unless the practice 
in question is so extensive and is supported 
by such a weight of legal opinion that the 
conditions governing the establishment of a 
common law practice are fulfill ed. And, 
what is even more important, the comts 
will not allow a particular professional 
group to develop a practice that is in 
conRict with society's sense of justice at any 
given time or against the prevailing view 
on fundamental human rights . 

If we, on this basis, return our attention 
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to the Annauer Hansen case, it is necessary 
to distinguish between operations and ex­
periments which are intended to help the 
individual patient and those that are in­
tended to gain new knowledge and thereby 
benefit other present or future patients. 

When it is a case of treating an individu­
al patient, a great deal is required before 
the legal authorities will interfere wi{1h the 
individual doctor's arrangements (13). But 
when one is concerned with operations or 
more painful or intrusive experiments, one 
is faced with the problem of the patient's 
consent. The Norwegian Criminal Code 
distinguishes between two types of bodily 
harm. As regards the ordinary, unspecified 
form of bodily harm, the rule is that the 
patient's consent is a defense against a 
criminal charge. This provision applies in 
the case of ordinary operations, such as 
those which require total anesthesia, since 
section 229 of the Act specifically mentions 
inducing a state of unconsciousness as an 
example of ordinary bodily harm. In the 
case of the more grievous forms of bodily 
harm, on the other hand, such as loss of 
sight or hearing, or lengthy illness, we have 
no provision excluding criminal liability in 
the event of consent. Nevertheless it is 
certain enough that in Norway, as in other 
countries, a serious operation, for example 
an amputation, is lawful when consent has 
been given and the interventit>n is medical­
ly necessary or desirable. But, in the case of 
both types of bodily harm, it is the law that 
thc operation, even if it is in itself medical­
ly defensible, is not justified if the patient 
opposes it. A normal adult person can thus 
not be compelled to undergo a serious 
cancer operation even if the prognosis is 
death if the disease is permitted to run its 
COurse. Doubtful questions in this context 
relate to situations in which it is not pos­
sibl e to obtain the patient's consent because 
he is unconscious, and to the degree to 
which the patient shall be informed of the 
seriousness of the disease and the operation 
before his consent is obtained. In the 
present context I shall lct thesc ques tions 
go unanswered, since they do not really 
concern the forensic approach adopted in 
the Armauer Hansen case (14), and will 
only make the observation that in a case of 

doubt one must rcsort to what is defensible 
and necessary, i.e., in accordance with gen­
eral medical ethics. 

A completely different situation arises in 
the case of operations and experiments that 
are not undertaken for the benefit of the 
individual patient. Here we come across a 
whole range of cases. At one extreme one 
can. mention the experiments with mental 
defectives in Nazi Germany which were 
revealed at the Nuremberg trials; transac­
tions which in their thorough contempt for 
the integrity of the individual human being 
cast aside every vestige of medical ethics, 
and which are directly contrary to legal 
provisions relating to serious bodily in­
juries. At the other end of the scale, we find 
the routine and only slightly disturbing 
investigations of patients in hospitals. 
There is reason to assume that such investi­
gations are undertaken to a rather greater 
extent than is necessary for the b enefit of 
the individual patient, but, provided that 
they are not dangerous and not specially 
distressing, I have little doubt that they are 
lawful even without the express consent of 
the patient. 

It is the cases in between that are of 
interest in the present context; experiments 
which entail a certain risk or which are 
inseparable from considerable pain or 
suffering. In these cases one must, in my 
opinion, unconditionally require that con­
sent on the part of the patient is necessary 
in order to render the experiment lawful 
(15) . In-so-far as a doctor is of the opinion 
that only experiments on human beings can 
lead to progress in mastering a disease, he 
is quite free to experiment on himself, as 
Danielssen did in 1844. Additionally, it will 
normally be lawful to experiment on 
coworkers or patients if they, after b eing 
fully informed, quite willingly give their 
consent. Beyond this one cannot go. Ac­
cordingly, consent must be a prerequisite if 
the experim ent is to be lawful, and the 
more serious the experiment is, the more 
stringent must be the requirements as re­
gards the patient's having a complete in­
sight into what he has consented to and as 
regards his complete freedom to give or 
withhold his consent. Clearly the require­
ment as to complete freedom becomes es-
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pecially rclcvant if cxperiments are under­
takcn on inmatcs of institutions, whether 
these be medical , sociological, or penal 
institutions. 

Finally, I concur with the Danish jurist 
in the sphere of crimin al law, Professor 
Hurwitz, in thinking that respect for indi­
vidual human life will set an ultimate limit 
to what cxperiments are permissible even 
when consent has been givcn (IIi). I would 
assume th at the requirements that I have 
here put forward do not exceed those rec­
ognized by Norwegian and international 
medical ethics, but it follows from what I 
have written above that I consider them as 
minimum requirements that the law must 
demand even if they were to go beyond 
what is acceptable by the medical profes­
sion at any given time. 

A certain amount of support for the 
views I have advocated can probably be 
found in the drafting of the Norwegian Act 
relating to transplantation. Both in the 
committee report and in the Act of Febru­
ary 9, 1972, it has been clearly stated, in 
accordance with current medical practice 
in Norway, that consent from a living donor 
can provide the basis for a lawful removal 
of organs from an adult, psychically healthy 
person for the purpose of transplantation , 
but only if the operation is of such a kind 
that it cannot lead to serious harm to the 
donor. There is a proposal to go beyond 
current practice by introducing a statutory 
provision that the consent shall be given in 
writing after the donor has been informed 
by a doctor of the nature of the operation 
and the risk it entails, while at the same 
time a duty is placed on the doctor to 
ensure that the person concerned has un­
derstood the explanation. But the Act ex­
pressly provides that the drawing of blood, 
skin biopsies, and other minor interventions 
can occur without transgressing the statuto­
ry provisions. I would assume that the 
principles on which the Transplantation 
Act is based will also be correspondingly 
applied to other operations or experiments 
which go beyond what is necessary to ben­
efi( the patient concerned. 
j As a conclusion I must then assume that 
the legal opinion on which the Armauer 
Hansen judgment was based also rep-

resents Norwcgian law in fo rce today. 
There is no reason to assume that an oper­
ation of the sort undertaken by Armauer 
H ansen would infringe the law if conscnt 
were first obtaincd, but the impcrativc con­
dition for lawfulness, namely consent and a 
complctely willing consent, was abscnt in 
his case. Should a similar case occur in the 
future, I also assumc that the prosccuting 
authority in Norway would be bound to 
take the case to court and that thc court 
would be bound to impose a conviction. 
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